
About
Providing crawl space and attic 
solutions in the Raleigh-Durham and 
Greenville areas. We accommodate 
various needs including insulation, 
mold remediation, encapsulations, 
vapor barriers, dehumidifier installation 
and much more. With more than 3 
years of experience and having helped 
over 200 home owners, we focus on 
providing customers with high quality 
solutions at a cost effective rate.

When did you start your business?
October 2016

Degree 
Management, Entrepreneurship

Hometown
Holly Springs, NC

Favorite Quote
"Whether you think you can or think you 
can't, you're right." - Henry Ford

Contact Information
www.CarolinaCasa.com
919-630-3202

Ryan Leheny, Owner
919-630-3202
Ryan@CarolinaCasa.com

Taylor

Hicks

About
Simple & Sentimental creates unique, 
hand lettered goods. We are best 
known for our bridesmaid proposal 
boxes! In addition to our wedding and 
engagement products, we carry wine 
glasses, t-shirts, candles, and more.

When did you start your business?
My first online sale was in December of 
2016, but it really took off during the 
summer of 2017! I had no idea at the 
time that something I was doing for fun 
would become my career.

Degree/ Major
Management, Small Business 
Management & Entrepreneurship

Hometown
Clemmons, NC

Favorite Quote
"Whatever you do, work at it with all 
your heart, as working for the Lord" -
Colossians 3:23

Contact Information
simplesentimental.com
taylor@simplesentimental.com


